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"We specialize in bringing you in-line with the real India - traditions, rituals, beauty, heauty, heritage, festivals, 
adventures,wild life, carnivals and many more different facets of our country- INDIA".

TRAVEL PLAN

Dear Traveler

Greetings from ALifetimeTrip

Thank you for choosing us for your travel needs.

Please find herewith all the relevant details (Itinerary, Accommodation) for your trip to 
Vietnam New Year Special: 25th Dec 2023-1st Jan 2024.Kindly take a moment to review 
these.

The travel plan is totally customizable. Please reach your tour planner and ask for changes 
that you would like to incorporate in your vacation.

We value your business and look forward to assist you.

Detailed Itinerary
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/home/alifetim/public_html/htmltopdf/info@alifetimetrip.com
https://www.facebook.com/ALifetimeTrip
https://twitter.com/alifetimetrip
https://www.linkedin.com/company/alifetimetrip


Tour Itinerary: Hanoi(1N)-Danang(3N)-Hue(1N)-Hanoi(1N)-Amanda Cruise(1N)

Day 1: Arrival at Hanoi
Meet on arrival at Hanoi / Noi Bai International Airport, transfer to city centre. Today you 
are at leisure.

Day 2: Hanoi City Tour
Morning, start of the tour journey visit by coach trip along the Hanoi Old Quarter. After that 
we take you to visit Ho Chi Minh complex, including Ho Chi Minh’s Mausoleum - the final 
resting place of Vietnamese great father or uncle Ho, President Ho Chi Minh’s stilt house- 
where Ho live done and off from 1958 to 1969, then visit Pillar Pagoda - a group of 
structures consisting of a pagoda and a tower built in the middle of a square lake. Leave One 
Pillar Pagoda for the Temple of Literature - the first college of Viet Nam and the place 
dedicating to Confucian. PM: Drive to visit Tran Quoc Pagoda, Which is on the shore of 
West Lake. Quan Thanh Temple and the Museum of Ethnology (Museum of history) - 
Where you can look at the cultural mosaic of 54 Vietnamese ethnic groups or Hoa Lo Prison 
Museum which originally used by the French Colonists in Indochina for political prisoners, 
and later by north Vietnam for U.S.prisoners of war during the Vietnam War. During this 
later period, it was known to American POWs as the Hanoi Hilton. The last place of city tour 
is Hoan Kiem Lake (Restored Sword Lake) with Ngoc Son Temple to see the peaceful green 
waters, The Huc Bridge, Thap But (Pen Tower), Old Train Street. Then take transfer to Noi 
Bai Airport for flight to Danang. Arrive Danang, check in hotel and O/N in Danang.

Day 3: Explore Hoi An & Old Town Vibes.
After breaAfter breakfast at hotel transfer to Danang visit to Marble Mountains and Thuan 
Phuoc Bridge to visit Son Tra Peninsula named as Monkey Mountain, visit Linh Ung 
Pagoda, city along the Red Beach Bay. Then travelling to Cam Thanh water coconut village. 
While the boat cruises along the river, observing beautiful HoiAn rural lives with water 
coconut forest in the background. Transferring from the main boat to the bamboo basket boat 
and slowly rowing to the village. Having an opportunity to learn how to row this unique 
bamboo basket boat then participating in a bamboo basket boat race. Together with local 
fishermen, throwing fish nets, catching fishes, mud-crabs, coconut mussels (an indigenous 
specie that can only be found here) and turning coconut leaves into fun items. Continue 
transfer to Hoi An. Hoi An – Known as Faifo to early Western trades, Hoi an was one of 
South East Asia’s major international ports and today it still retains that special old-world 
feel. During a guided walking tour through the history city center of Hoi An town, we visit 
the Chinese Assembly Hall and Temple (Kwan or Phuc Kien Temple), Ancient Houses (Tan 
Ky or Phung Hung House), Japanese Bridge and cultural show rooms: Quan Thang House 
(Sa Huynh Museum or History Museum). Shopping at Hoi an Market. Back to Danang. O/N 
in Danang.kfast at hotel transfer to Danang visit to Marble Mountains and Thuan Phuoc 
Bridge to visit Son Tra Peninsula named as Monkey Mountain, visit Linh Ung Pagoda, city 
along the Red Beach Bay. Then travelling to Cam Thanh water coconut village. While the 
boat cruises along the river, observing beautiful HoiAn rural lives with water coconut forest 
in the background. Transferring from the main boat to the bamboo basket boat and slowly 
rowing to the village. Having an opportunity to learn how to row this unique bamboo basket 
boat then participating in a bamboo basket boat race. Together with local fishermen, 
throwing fish nets, catching fishes, mud-crabs, coconut mussels (an indigenous specie that 
can only be found here) and turning coconut leaves into fun items. Continue transfer to Hoi 
An. Hoi An – Known as Faifo to early Western trades, Hoi an was one of South East Asia’s 
major international ports and today it still retains that special old-world feel. During a guided 
walking tour through the history city center of Hoi An town, we visit the Chinese Assembly 
Hall and Temple (Kwan or Phuc Kien Temple), Ancient Houses (Tan Ky or Phung Hung 
House), Japanese Bridge and cultural show rooms: Quan Thang House (Sa Huynh Museum 
or History Museum). Shopping at Hoi an Market. Back to Danang. O/N in Danang.

Day 4: Golden Hand Bridge @ Ba Na Hills.
Breakfast at hotel. 08:00: Pick up from hotel. Depart to Ba Na Hills. 09:00: Arrive at the 
cable car station Suoi Mo, up the cable car route that achieves 4 world records. 09:30: 
Freedom check-in the 150-meter long Golden Bridge supported by the huge hands. Visit the 
Le Jardin, Debay Wine Cellar of French. Visit the Linh Ung pagoda, admire the 27m high 
Buddha statue, Loc Uyen Garden, Quan Am Cac. Continue to Gare Debay use the second 
cable car route to go to the top of Ba Na. The tour guide will take guests to visit Fantasy 
Park, join in adventurous, fun, and modern games such as Love Swing, Skiver Pilot, Fire 
Racing Track, Bumper Car, Ghost House... 12:30: Freedom to rest. Conquer the Peak of 
Chua Mountain at the height of 1,487m – Visit Ba Chua Thuong Ngan Temple. Enjoy the 
panorama view of the Da Nang City and Da Nang Bay 15:30: Return to cable car station and 
back to Da Nang. 17:00: Shopping Local Specialties. Transfers to Hotel.

Day 5: Train Ride to Hue & Perfume River.
07:30: Pick up guest at hotels and depart to Hue city. World Cultural Heritage, Go through 
Hai Van Tunnel 10:30: Arrive at Hue city. Visit the Tomb of Tu Duc king or Khai Dinh 
king - Romance, lyrical reflects the life of the king of talented but situation in the country 
intricate. 11:40: Have lunch at restaurant with local foods. 12:30: Visit the Imperial Citadel, 
(the Palace of 13 Nguyenu2019s Kings, the last feudal dynasty of Viet Nam: Ngo Mon Gate, 
Thai Hoa Palace, The Temple, Hien Lam pavilion, Nine Urns), having experiences with 
virtual 3D scanning concept u201cFinding the lost palaceu201d 15:00: Visit Thien Mu 
pagoda ancient, was built in the early of XVII Century. Shopping at Dong Ba Market. 16:00: 
Transfers to hotel. O/N in Hue

Day 6: Fly to Hanoi. Enjoy Nightlife
After breakfast proceed to Airport for your flight to Hanoi. Enjoy on own a great nightlife in 
Hanoi. O/N in Hanoi.

Day 7: Hanoi - Halong Bay - New Year Night on Cruise
Transfer to Halong Bay (165 km east of Hanoi), listed as a World Heritage Area of 
outstanding natural beauty. u201cDragon descending to the seau201d as it is known in 
Vietnamese, picturesque Halong Bay has more than 1,000 limestone islets rising from the 
sea, many of them containing beautiful grottoes. Noon time, you will board the boutique 
wooden junk to visit Halong Bay. While cruising through the bay, seafood lunch is served on 
board. Continue cruising to visit caves; islands, floating fishing village and relax on the 
board. Evening, enjoy movie night, board games, and squid fishing or relax at leisure . 
Dinner and Overnight on the boat.

Day 8: Onward Home
Today, after a delicious breakfast, you shall proceed towards International Airport, for your 
journey back home with great memories of ALifetimeTrip.

Hotel Details:CITIESHOTELSHanoi-1NDanang-3NHue-1NHanoi-1NAmanda Cruise-1NPACKAGE COST INCLUDESPACKAGE COST EXCLUDESAll Applicable TaxesDriver Allowances, toll taxes, parking, state taxesBreakfast in meal menu.Local Tour Manager(Only if 10 Pax)All Applicable Taxes30 Days Single Entry Vietnam E-visa Indian Lunch And Dinner Set MenuHa Long Bay Cruise Lunch + Dinner + Breakfast + Brunch International MealBoat excursions in Halong Bay and Mekong DeltaVietnamese souvenirTravel Insurance available on request.Any expenses for optional activities.Notes:Please NoteWritten cancellation will be accepted on working days (only). Any cancellation sent on a Sunday or any National Holiday(s) or after office hours, will be considered on the next official working day.In the event of any cancellation(s) after trip commencement, there will be no refunds and any costs incurred due to this cancellation will be borne by you.* Irrespective of when a trip is booked, the above condition will hold trueBank DetailsThis is terms and condition contentCancellation PolicyIn the event of cancellation, we must be notified of the same in writing over email. Cancellation charges willbe effective from the date we receive the request in writing.Retention charges will be as follows: Booking amount anytime after the tour confirmation.50% of the Tour Amount between 30-44 days of Tour Start Date.75% of the Tour Amount between 15-29 days of Tour Start Date.100% of the Tour Amount between 0-14 days of Tour Start Date.Terms & ConditionsAll extras are to be paid directly to the hotels/service providers.Any service unused is non-refundable.


